
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
April 1, 2015    Copier/Printer/Computer/Electrical Supplies, Bid #152104 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual purchasing agreement to provide copier/printer/electrical parts and supplies (sixty-eight 
(68) items bid; fifty-eight (58) items recommended for award) to be stocked and distributed by the 
Central Warehouse.  Items not awarded due to lack of bidder response or failure to provide a sample 
to be tested for acceptance.  Items will be purchased on an as needed basis to replenish the Central 
Warehouse inventory.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications and offering 
minimum ordering levels acceptable to the District.   
 
Effective Dates:  May 1, 2015 through April 30, 2016. 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Central Warehouse 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:      ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
  
 A Group, LLC, Milton, FL     18    $ 22,100.00 
 Automated Technical Systems, Pride, LA   3       12,900.00 
 B&H Photo Video,  New York, NY    2                                 2,600.00 
 Global Gov, Fletcher, OH    22         44,800.00 
 Laserlink International, Emeryville, CA      2         6,700.00 
         Quill , Lincolnshire, IL            11          28,500.00 
  
 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$117,600.00 Est. / Yr.   General Fund (1110) – Regular Operations   
     

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 11 Responses Rejected:  3 
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
April 1, 2015, 12:00 pm CST 

 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard 

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business
Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $31.00 $31.00 $25.00 $25.00 $36.00 $36.00 $28.00 $28.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $23.70 $24.89 1 $27.00 $28.35 1 $34.95 $36.70 1 $29.90 $31.40 1

O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $23.39 $24.56 $40.61 $42.64 $37.03 $38.88 $53.84 $56.53
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $25.00 $26.25 1 $47.00 $49.35 1 $57.00 $59.85 1 $57.00 $59.85 1

O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $33.00 $33.00 $41.00 $41.00 $94.00 $94.00 $33.00 $33.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $31.66 $33.24 1 $38.32 $40.24 1 $89.00 $93.45 1 $35.62 $37.40 1
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $25.31 $26.58 $58.62 $61.55 $77.63 $81.51 $29.69 $31.17
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $29.00 $30.45 1 $60.00 $63.00 1 $92.00 $96.60 1 $39.00 $40.95 1
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $59.00 $59.00 $15.70 $15.70 E $18.50 $18.50 $11.00 $11.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $68.25 $71.66 1 $23.25 $24.41 1 $26.55 $27.88 1 $16.50 $17.33 1

O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $102.04 $107.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $109.00 $114.45 1 $35.00 $36.75 1 $25.00 $26.25 1 $20.00 $21.00 1

O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Number:
Bid Title: 

Not Awarded

**
5/Developer 355/455

FL. Pref. Adj.
6/Toner 355/455 7/Toner 620 + MX-M550 8/Developer 620 + MX-M550

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

1/Developer 350/450 3/Toner 350/450

23-Mar-15
152104

Copier/Printer/Computer/Electrical Supplies
Recommended Award

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL 32505

2/Drum 350/450 4/Drum 355/455
FL. Pref. Adj.

BID TABULATION

**

Date: 

FL. Pref. Adj.
9/Drum 620 + MX-M550 10/Toner SF-2030 & 2040 11/Toner 286/336/337/405 12/Toner 2522

**
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $30.00 $30.00 Inc. $75.00 $75.00 $24.00 $24.00 $31.00 $31.00

O Automated Tech Systems 5% $196.50 $206.33 1 $35.60 $37.38 1 $35.00 $36.75 1 $33.12 $34.78 1

O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $175.48 $184.25 $62.95 $66.10 $35.82 $37.61 $48.04 $50.44
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $139.00 $145.95 1 $53.00 $55.65 1 $62.00 $65.10 1 $55.00 $57.75 1
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $20.00 $20.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $60.60 $63.63 1 $60.60 $63.63 1 $60.60 $63.63 1 $30.25 $31.76 1
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $82.86 $87.00 $82.86 $87.00 $82.26 $86.37 $64.59 $67.82
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $85.00 $89.25 1 $85.00 $89.25 1 $85.00 $89.25 1 $41.00 $43.05 1
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $30.00 $30.00 $49.00 $49.00 $49.00 $49.00 $49.00 $49.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $36.25 $38.06 1 $56.25 $59.06 1 $56.25 $59.06 1 $56.25 $59.06 1
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $58.35 $61.27 $82.26 $86.37 $82.26 $86.37 $82.26 $86.37
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $54.00 $56.70 1 $85.00 $89.25 1 $85.00 $89.25 1 $85.00 $89.25 1
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $114.00 $114.00 $405.00 $405.00 $170.00 $170.00 $54.00 $54.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $101.87 $106.96 1 $195.00 $204.75 1 $134.00 $140.70 1 $59.30 $62.27 1
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $85.38 $89.65 $315.00 $330.75 $127.22 $133.58 $50.93 $53.48
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $89.00 $93.45 1 $321.00 $337.05 1 $129.00 $135.45 1 $57.00 $59.85 1
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

** FL. Pref. Adj.
25/Developer, MX-850 26/Drum, MX-850 27/Toner, MX-850 28/Developer, MX-M363

** FL. Pref. Adj.
21/Toner MX-2700 22/Toner, Cyan MX-2700 23/Toner, Magenta MX-2700 24/Toner, Yellow MX-2700

** FL. Pref. Adj.
17/Toner, Cyan MX-2600 18/Toner, Magenta MX-2600 19/Toner, Yellow MX-2600 20/Drum MX-2700

** FL. Pref. Adj.
13/Drum 2522 14/Toner, MX-3100 15/Drum, MX-2600/3100/4100 16/Toner, Black, MX-2600
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $24.50 $24.50 $44.00 $44.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% $30.00 $31.50 1 $45.70 $47.99 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $43.84 $46.03 $71.29 $74.85 $57.07 $59.92 Rhino No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $52.00 $54.60 1 $69.00 $72.45 1 $69.00 $72.45 A, NS, 1 $54.00 $56.70 A, NS,1
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.15 $126.16 Dell, 6 $115.70 $121.49 Dell, 6
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $165.00 $165.00 $39.00 $39.00 $37.00 $37.00 $30.00 $30.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $146.52 $153.85 $34.43 $36.15 $33.02 $34.67 $26.19 $27.50
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $115.00 $120.75 1 $37.00 $38.85 1 $36.00 $37.80 1 $29.00 $30.45 1
O Quill 5% $146.73 $154.07 $36.93 $38.78 $35.41 $37.18 $29.47 $30.94
O Southern Computer Whse 5% $147.98 $155.38 $34.97 $36.72 $33.53 $35.21 $26.59 $27.92

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $35.00 $35.00 $26.00 $26.00 $40.50 $40.50 $27.50 $27.50
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $31.22 $32.78 $22.85 $23.99 $35.94 $37.74 $23.88 $25.07
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $33.00 $34.65 1 $25.00 $26.25 1 $39.63 $41.61 1 $26.00 $27.30 1
O Quill 5% $33.47 $35.14 $25.70 $26.99 $38.54 $40.47 $26.86 $28.20
O Southern Computer Whse 5% $31.68 $33.26 $23.18 $24.34 $36.49 $38.31 $24.24 $25.45

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $22.00 $22.00 $26.00 $26.00 $15.50 $15.50 $21.00 $21.00
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $19.27 $20.23 $22.85 $23.99 $13.72 $14.41 $18.47 $19.39
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $20.50 $21.53 1 $25.00 $26.25 1 $16.00 $16.80 1 $21.00 $22.05 1
O Quill 5% $21.68 $22.76 $25.70 $26.99 $15.45 $16.22 $20.80 $21.84
O Southern Computer Whse 5% $19.55 $20.53 $23.18 $24.34 $13.94 $14.64 $18.77 $19.71

**

**

34/HP 51645A 35/HP 68766WN

FL. Pref. Adj.
29/Drum, MX-M363 30/Toner, MX-M363 31/Dell Cartridge, High Yield 31/Dell Cartridge, Low Yield

38/HP C6657A 39/HP C8728AN

** FL. Pref. Adj.
32/HP Q5949X

Not Awarded

33/HP C6578DN

FL. Pref. Adj.
36/HP C6615DN 37/HP C6656A

** FL. Pref. Adj.
40/HP C8727AN 41/HP C8765WN 42/HP C9351A 43/HP C9352A
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% $22.33 $23.45 $22.85 $23.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $25.00 $26.25 1 $25.00 $26.25 1 $8.60 $9.03 E, 1 $3.33 $3.50 A, NS, 1
O Quill 5% $25.12 $26.38 $15.45 $16.22 $7.03 $7.38 $6.65 $6.98 A, NS
O Southern Computer Whse 5% $22.66 $23.79 $23.18 $24.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $11.00 $11.00 Inc. $1.20 $1.20 Inc. No Bid No Bid $21.00 $21.00 Inc.
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% $7.99 $8.39 A, NS $1.95 $2.05 $4.99 $5.24 $12.95 $13.60
O Global Gov 5% $7.86 $8.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.77 $13.41
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% $14.00 $14.70 1 $5.00 $5.25 1 $14.00 $14.70 1 No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% $18.98 $19.93 $0.56 $0.59 $3.41 $3.58 $19.61 $20.59
O Southern Computer Whse 5% $9.48 $9.95 $0.94 $0.99 No Bid No Bid $13.23 $13.89

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $30.00 $30.00 Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% $19.43 $20.40 $5.40 $5.67 A, NS $14.65 $15.38 A, NS $26.25 $27.56 A, NS
O Global Gov 5% $24.19 $25.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% $33.71 $35.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% $20.79 $21.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Not Awarded

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded

FL. Pref. Adj.
44/HP C9361 WB 45/HP C9364 WN 46/Toner Cleaning Cloth 47/ Canned Air

**

FL. Pref. Adj.
52/Surge strip, 8 plug 53/Ext. Cord, 12' 54/Ext. Cord, 25' 55/ Ext. Cord, 50'

** FL. Pref. Adj.
48/Flash Drive 49/Mouse pad 50/Anti-static wipe 51/Surge strip, 7 plug

**

** FL. Pref. Adj.
56/Cord cap, 15A/125v 57/Elect. Tape 58/Cord cap, 20A/125v 59/Duplex receptacle
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid $38.95 $40.90 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.99 $16.79 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.07 $22.12 3 $0.37 $0.39 2
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% $0.80 $0.84 4 $0.89 $0.93 5 $1.78 $1.87 3 $0.42 $0.44 4
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid
O Automated Tech Systems 5% No Bid No Bid
O B&H 5% No Bid No Bid
O Global Gov 5% No Bid No Bid
O Lamination Depot 5% No Bid No Bid
O Laserlink International 5% No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% $3.90 $4.10
O Southern Computer Whse 5% No Bid No Bid

A Alternate Item Bid
NS No Sample provided
DNBAS     Did not bid as specified
Inc  Bid item missing information, unable to confirm, not accepted
1 P-card use incurs fees
2 Min order 16 qty
3 Order in multiples of 2 qty
4 Order in multiples of 8/pk
5 Order in multiples of 4/pk
6 Order in multiples of 70 qty

Not Awarded

NOTES:

FL. Pref. Adj.

**

**

FL. Pref. Adj.
64/D Battery 65/C Battery 66/9V Battery 67/AAA Battery

68/6V Battery

FL. Pref. Adj.
60/Ground receptacle 61/8" Speaker 62/Laminating film 63/AA Battery

**
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-
fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.  Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida 
Statues and School Board Rules.  Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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